Des Moines Public Schools

DesMoines
PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid / Quote: Q7263
Date: July 20, 2015
Supervisor: Connie Sievers

lowa Prison Pay-Less Office
Industries Office Leader Products
Des Moines, K-Log Brooklyn, New West Des Staples
Description lowa Zion, IL York Moines, IA Urbandale, IA

1. CPU Holder - QTY 27 each

K-Log #HFW-CPV OR EQUAL

Make Bid Adj CPU Holder Spec K-Log Mead Hatcher 3M
Model Bid SPE 3792-G Spec Spec MAT 26155 CS200MB
Cost per Unit S 31.00 | S 103.00 | $ 87.00| S 51.65 | S 87.29
Total Cost S 837.00 | $ 2,781.00 | $§ 2,349.00 | $ 1,39455 | $ 2,356.83
Warranty 10 years| Limited 10 year| Lifetime Limited 5 year
2. Height Adjustable Flip Top Work Station - Qty 12 each

K-Log # HFW-7230 OR EQUAL

Make Bid Flip Top Station Spec K-Log ABCO Balt
Model Bid SPE 3792-H Spec Spec CCFLAA3072 90317-7224
Cost per Unit S 515.00 | $ 733.00 | $ 389.00 | S 27955 | S 533.81
Total Cost S 6,180.00 | $ 8,796.00 | $ 4,668.00 | S 3,354.60 $6,405.72
Warranty Limited Lifetime| Limited 10 year| Lifetime Limited 1vyear
3. 48" Computer Table - Qty 1 each

K-Log # OCTC-55 OR EQUAL

Make Bid 2900 Series Spec ABCO No Bid OFM
Model Bid SPE 3792-I Spec CCFL 24489 $55,103.00
Cost per Unit S 235.00 | S 243.77 | S 186.00 S 167.33
Total Cost S 235.00 | S 24377 | S 186.00 S 167.33
Warranty Lifetime Limited 10 yr frame/ 5 yr top

4. Stack Chair w/Glides - Qty 24 each

Add $171.00 for

K-Log # FSS-SC OR EQUAL BALT Freight Set of 2 each
Make Bid Revelation Poly Spec K-Log Balt Balt
Model Bid Frapture NAPBL Spec Spec 34554 34554
Cost per Unit S 104.50 | S 11093 | $ 92.00 | $§ 303.50 | $ 300.12
Total Cost S 2,508.00 | $ 2,662.32 | S 2,208.00 | $§ 1,821.00 | $ 3,601.44
Warranty 10 years 1 year| Lifetime Limited

Q7263 Engineering Classroom Furniture 1 7/21/2015



Des Moines Public Schools

lowa Prison Pay-Less Office
Industries Office Leader Products
Des Moines, K-Log Brooklyn, New West Des Staples
Description lowa Zion, IL York Moines, IA Urbandale, IA
5. Set of 8 Casters for Stack Chairs - Qty 13 each
K-Log #FSS-CST OR EQUAL
Make Bid Copers Spec K-Log Balt Balt
Model Bid FCSTRSLTZ Spec Spec 34644 34644
Cost per Unit S 16.00 | S 22.85 | Includedline4 | S 29.02 27.79
Total Cost S 208.00 | S 297.05 S 174.12 194.53
Warranty 1vyear
6. Multi Shift 24/7 Stool w/ arms - QTY 1 each
K-Log #EHP-24FA-S OR EQUAL
Make Bid Navigator Stool Spec K-Log| Office Manager OFM
Model Bid FNAVSTOOLA Spec Spec 1455 241-AA-DK
Cost per Unit S 33155 | $ 404.96 | S 268.00 | $ 290.00 253.37
Total Cost S 33155 | $ 404.96 | $ 268.00 | $ 290.00 253.37
Warranty 10 YEARS| Limited Lifetime] Lifetime Limited 7 years
7. 4 Tier Binder Carousel - Qty 1 each
K-Log #EIBC-4 OR EQUAL
Make Bid No Bid Spec No Bid No Bid Bindetrek
Model Bid Spec CLA-80
Cost per Unit S 1,421.84 1,117.09
Total Cost S 1,421.84 1,117.09
Warranty 5 year
8. Open Binder Carsousel Worktop Cover - Qty 1 each
K-Log #EIBC-WC OR EQUAL
Make Bid No Bid Spec No Bid No Bid Bindertek
Model Bid Spec CLS-80
Cost per Unit S 242.26 86.19
Total Cost S 242.26 86.19
Warranty Limited 5 year 5 year
9. Caster Set for Binder Carousel - Qty 1 each
K-Log # EIBC-C OR EQUAL
Make Bid No Bid Spec No Bid No Bid Bindertek
Model Bid Spec CLC-80
Cost per Unit S 104.42 91.19
Total Cost S 104.42 91.19
Warranty Limited 5 year
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Des Moines Public Schools

lowa Prison Pay-Less Office
Industries Office Leader Products
Des Moines, K-Log Brooklyn, New West Des Staples
Description lowa Zion, IL York Moines, IA Urbandale, IA

10. Optional Slide out Keyboard Tray - Qty 24 each

K-Log # HFW-KBT OR EQUAL

Make Bid KeyBoard Tray Spec ABCO Sok| Harmony/Storlie 3M
Model Bid SPE 3792-K Spec ABCO Sok SLT538BK KD45
Cost per Unit S 46.00 | S 123.00 | $ 64.00 [ § 39.15( S 122.48
Total Cost S 1,104.00 | $ 2,952.00 | $ 1,536.00 | § 939.60 | S 2,939.52
Warranty 10 Years| Limited 10 year| Lifetime Limited

11. Steel Open Bookcase Red - Qty 4 each

K-Log # LM-329 or Equal

Make Bid 630 Style Spec Sandusky Sandusky Sandusky
Model Bid SPE 3792-) Spec BA10341230 BA341230-01 BA10341230-01
Cost per Unit S 140.00 | S 178.25| S 130.00 | S 91.02 | S 141.73
Total Cost S 560.00 | $ 713.00 | $ 520.00 | S 364.08 | S 566.92
Warranty Limited Lifetime| Limited 5 year| Lifetime Limited 5 years
GRAND TOTAL S 11,963.55 | S 20,618.62 | S 11,735.00 | § 8337.95| S 17,780.13
Note: Lead time varies by item, some have a 6 week leadtime

No Bids: Midwest Technology Products,Brown & Saenger,ATD American,
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