DesMoines
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Des Moines Public Schools

6/6/2014

Bid / Quote:
Date:
Supervisor:
Department:
Central Restaurant
Buller Fixture, Products Culinary Depot, | Douglas Equipment | Dupey Equipment, Ecolab Horizon Products IADSM Supply
Item # |Description Qty UoM Omaha, NE Indianpolis, In Monsey, NY Bluefield, WV Clive, IA Fort Worth, TX Brighton, MA Des Moines, IA
1|Spoons Stainless Steel Economy
Windsor or equal 10,000 |Each 996 ea 10,008 10,008 No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: WM-31 Update 795-407 0002-01 WINCO 0002-03 Update WM-31 Dinner
Cost: S 0.08083| S 0.09000| $ 0.09000| S 0.09500| $ 0.09000 S 0.13600
2|Forks Stainless Steel Economy-
Windsor or equal 15,000 [Each 15000 No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: WM-35 Update 795-411 0002-05 Winco0002-05 Update WM-35 Dinner
Cost: S 0.11083| S 0.15000( S 0.11000( S 0.09500| $ 0.12000 S 0.13600
3[Hot Pad Terry 8" Round: San Jamar
813Rph or equal 900 [Each No Bid Order in lots of 24
John Ritzenther
Brand Bid: Spec 117-105 Spec Spec Spec 7000 Spec
Cost: S 1.76| S 2.40] S 1.90 $ 1.54| S 1.69 S 2.04] $ 1.71
4|Apron, Bib, White cloth 750 |Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
600 BAW Chef Winco BA-PWH 31 x Chef Revival 600
Brand Bid: Revival 600 BAW 26 Chef Revival BAW
Cost: S 3.50 S 351 S 237 S 3.96 S 3.34
5[Serving Spoons: Vollrath 6412420
or Carlisle 604380 50 |Each No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: V 6412420 913-487 FPS-4 Carlisle Vollrath Carlisle
Cost: S 6.59| S 7.40( $ 1.05| $ 4.71] S 7.08 S 4.62
6(6. Dishers #6- Vollrath 47139 or
Carlisle 60300-6 50 [Each No Bid
Brand Bid: V. 47139 913-107 ICD-6 Carlisle Vollrath Winco ICD-6 Carlisle
Cost: S 6.59| S 7.44( S 3.54( S 7.30| $ 7.08 S 429 S 7.25
7|Dishers, #8 Vollrath 47140 or
Carlisle 60300-8 15 |Each No Bid
Brand Bid: V.47140 913-108 ICD-8 Carlisle Vollrath Winco ICD-8 Carlisle
Cost: S 6.59| S 7.44( S 3.54( S 7.62| S 7.46 S 4.29| S 7.25
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Des Moines Public Schools

Central Restaurant
Buller Fixture, Products Culinary Depot, | Douglas Equipment | Dupey Equipment, Ecolab Horizon Products IADSM Supply
Item # |Description Qty UoM Omaha, NE Indianpolis, In Monsey, NY Bluefield, WV Clive, IA Fort Worth, TX Brighton, MA Des Moines, IA
8|Cutter, Pizza, 4" White - Mundial
W5691-4 or Equal 15 |Each 18 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Metalcraft
Brand Bid: Spec 125-206 PPC-4 PIZW1 Spec
Cost: S 11.11] S 533] S 1.59 $ 5.59| S 11.43
9[Insulating IceMatting - Thermo
Safe Utek #405 30 |Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec Spec Spec
Cost: S 181.81f $ 111.39 $168.00
10|Knife, Serrated 8" blade Mundial
W5627-8E 10 |Each 12ea No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec Spec Spec Spec 30353-00-00 Dexter P94803
Cost: S 8.93 S 12.42| S 12.31] $ 9.03| $ 9.14 S 5.31
11|Knife, Paring 3 1/4 " Blade Mundial
SCW5601 100 |Each No Bid
Brand Bid: #104-50 Dexter 130-135 KWH-1 Spec Spec 30350-00-00 KWH-1
Cost: S 363| S 417 $ 399 $ 8.48| $ 332| $ 3.65| $ 2.42
12|Galaxy Pastry Brush 3" - Carlisle
40392 10 |Each 12 ea No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec W269-40392 Roy BR P300 Spec Carlisle 40392 Winco NB30 Spec
Cost: S 6.44| S 7.50| S 2.52| S 599 $ 7.09 S 3.75| $ 4.66
13|Thermometer, Oven - Taylor 5932 10 [Each No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec W511-5932 TMT-0V3 CDN DOT2 Spec 40202-01-11 Winco TMT-0OV3
Cost: S 331 S 4.15| $ 2.06| S 5.90( $ 343| $ 6.38] S 2.50
14|Thermometer, Refri/Freezer,
Taylor 3507 100 |Each 102 ea No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 511-073 TMT-RF2 CDN RFT1 Spec 43004-03-11 Winco TMT-RF2
Cost: S 247| S 3.24] S 1.54 $ 2.97| $ 242 S 3.52| S 1.87
15|Thermometer, Instant Read -
Taylor 9848E 5 100 |Each 102 ea No Bid
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Des Moines Public Schools

Central Restaurant
Buller Fixture, Products Culinary Depot, | Douglas Equipment | Dupey Equipment, Ecolab Horizon Products IADSM Supply
Item # |Description Qty UoM Omaha, NE Indianpolis, In Monsey, NY Bluefield, WV Clive, IA Fort Worth, TX Brighton, MA Des Moines, IA
Brand Bid: Spec 511-017 TMT-DG1 CDN DIT450 Spec 43001-03-11 Winco TMT-DG4
Cost: S 15.04| $ 19.89| $ 4.47( S 11.36| S 14.88| S 15.68| $ 7.03
16|Can Opener, Manual Edlund S-11 10 |Each No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 745-037 Spec Spec Spec 50608-01-00 Winco C530
Cost: S 355.84| S 410.00| $ 425.15| $ 363.31| S 401.96| $ 357.83| S 3.55
17|Can Opener Cleaning Brush -
Edlund ST 93 75 |Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 745-065 Spec Spec Spec
Cost: S 22.71] S 28.00| S 25.06| $ 23.22| S 25.98
18(Spatula 13 5/8" - Vollrath 52013 20 |Cases No Bid No Bid
American Metalcraft
Brand Bid: Spec 913-515 PSC-14 PLC14 Spec Winco PSC14
Cost: S 11.99| $ 13.50| $ 484 S 7.02| S 12.44 S 5.88
19| 8" Scrub Brush - Ecolab 60702-200-
00 50 |Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Carlisle 332-035 BRN-8P Carlisle 3662000 Spec
Cost: S 591 S 2.78] S 5.20 S 7.82
20|Tongs, 12" long Scallop grip -
Cambro 12TGS 13 |Cases
Brand Bid: Spec 250-245 Put-12K Cambro 12TGS110 Spec 30430-09-00 Winco UT-12 Spec
Cost: S 30.96( S 29.16| $ 9.27| $ 29.04| S 30.12| $ 7.24| S 15.96| S 27.93
21|Pans, Polycarbonate Camwear -
Cambro 26CW 50 |Cases No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 250-382 Spec Cambro 26CW135 Spec Winco SP7206 Spec
Cost: S 48.50| S 49.80| S 49.16| S 44.70| $ 53.70 S 37.62| S 44.81
22]|Lid w/handle fit half size pan -
Cambro 20CWC 10 |Cases No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 250-383 Spec| Cambro 20CWC135 Spec Spec
Cost: S 23.60 S 24.84( $ 2441 S 23.88| S 22.56 S 22.25
23|Polycarbonate Lids Grip - Cambro
20CWGL 20 |Cases No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: Spec 250-385 Spec| Cambro 20CWGL135 Spec Spec
Cost: S 61.47( S 69.06 $ 68.34 S 62.04( S 65.58 S 62.29
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Des Moines Public Schools

Central Restaurant
Buller Fixture, Products Culinary Depot, | Douglas Equipment | Dupey Equipment, Ecolab Horizon Products IADSM Supply
Item # |Description Qty UoM Omaha, NE Indianpolis, In Monsey, NY Bluefield, WV Clive, IA Fort Worth, TX Brighton, MA Des Moines, IA

24(Pans, Polycarbonate Camwear,

Cambro 36CW 4 |Cases No Bid

Brand Bid: Spec 250-393 Spec Cambro 36CW135 Spec SP7306 Spec

Cost: 34.82 37.68 37.09 40.62 36.54 28.62 33.81
25|Knife 8" Chef - Dexter #P94801 10 |Each

Brand Bid: Spec 973-049 KWH-6 Spec Spec 30355-00-00 Winco KWH6 Spec

Cost: S 9.70| S 8.54| S 5.49| $ 14.95( $ 12.19( S 11.70| $ 6.63[ S 8.34
26|Food Box - Cambro 12186CW 23 |Cases No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid: Spec 250-516 Spec| Cambro12186CW135 Spec Spec

Cost: S 70.01f S 80.52 $ 79.12 $ 74.34( S 72.36 S 72.12
27|Trays 2 x 2 Compartment Cambro

1596CW 24 |Cases No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid: Spec No Bid Spec| Cambro 1596CW416 Spec Spec

Cost: S 128.91 S 146.99( $ 124.80| S 136.08 S 133.98
28|Cutting Board 15x20 White -

Ecolab 30241-00-00 10 |Each No Bid No Bid

CBW1520( Update Intermodal San jamar

Brand Bid: ADCraft 481-002 CBWT-1520 CB152012WH Spec| Winco CBWT-1520

Cost: S 11.59| S 9.58 $ 7.63] $ 14.72 S 14.32| $ 9.21
29|Cutting Board 15x24 White -

Ecolab 30242-00-00 - 20 ea 20 |Each No Bid No Bid

CBW1824( Update Intermodal San Jamar

Brand Bid: ADCraft 481-003 CBWT-1824 CB182412WH Spec| Winco CBWT-1824

Cost: S 16.97 S 1437 S 11.30 $ 21.96 S 20.21] S 13.65
30|Detergent Bucket GRN - Ecolab

60504-42-31 20 |Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KP196GR San

Brand Bid: Jamar PPL-6G San Jamar KP196Gn Spec

Cost: S 47.36 S 17.88 S 18.72| S 17.91
31[Sanitizer Bucket Red - Ecolab

60503-42-31 20 [Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KP196RD San
Brand Bid: Jamar PPL-6R San Mamar KP196RD Spec
Cost: S 47.36 S 17.88 S 18.72] S 17.91
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Des Moines Public Schools

Central Restaurant

Buller Fixture, Products Culinary Depot, | Douglas Equipment | Dupey Equipment, Ecolab Horizon Products IADSM Supply
Item # |Description Qty UoM Omaha, NE Indianpolis, In Monsey, NY Bluefield, WV Clive, IA Fort Worth, TX Brighton, MA Des Moines, IA
32|Chlorine Test Strips - Ecolab 20311-
01-11 10 |Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: 142-1362 Spec
Cost: S 1.54 S 6.21
33|Sanitizer Test Strips QT 40 - Ecolab
20304-05-11 200 |Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid 192 roll No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: 142-1158 San Jamar SFCrollQT Spec
Cost: $ 7.37 S 8.32| $ 12.80
34|Therm T-Stick 160F - Ecolab 40907-
03-11 30 |Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid 250/bx No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid: 138-1115 San Jamar T3T-9343 Spec
Cost: S 23.32 S 45.00| S 36.46
Delivery Days ARO 30 days 2-3 Days 7-14 Days 20 Days 28 Days 3-5 Days 21 Days 10-12 Bus. Days
Can Opener Clamp
NOTES Freight Not Included $105.23/ea
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Des Moines Public Schools

Q7009

5/29/2014

Sandy Huisman

Central Nutrition

Reinhart Food
Kessenich's Ltd. Pasco Rapids Foodservice Service Restaurant Link Sam Tell & Sons | Star Food Service Sysco Tiger Chef
Item #| Madison, WI Plano, TX Marion, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Lawrence, KS Farmingdale NY Cedar Rapids, IA Ankeny, IA Suffern, Ny
1
9996 10,008 10,008 Must Order by Dozen 10,008 10,020 ea
Winco 0002-01 WALCO 7201 Winco 002-01 Proware 21644 Update WM-31 MWI-01 Spec Walco 7203| Winco 0002-01
S 0.07750| $ 0.11000 S 0.08000( S 0.11000 1.02| S 0.09000( $ 0.08833 0.30917| S 0.15000
2 Must Order by
15012 Dozen 10,020 ea
Winco 0002-05 Walco 7205 Winco 002-05 Proware 21780 Update WM-35 MWI-06 Spec Walco 7205/ Winco 00002-05
S 0.10667( $ 0.18000( S 0.11000( S 0.20000 1.41f S 0.14000| $ 0.12167 0.14083| S 0.15000
3
912 ea
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 1.82000| $ 2.10 $1.74| $ 1.70 1.84( S 1.84| $ 1.99 1.90( $ 2.00
4 756
Chef Revival John Ritzenthaler
600BAW|Chef Revival 600BAW Winco BA-PWH 88876 Update BAP-WH Stanton 3901 Winco BA-PWH| Winco BA-PWH
S 3.20| $ 3.35| S 3.03| $ 2.50 2.92| S 1.94| S 4.30 3.29| S 3.33
5
Vollrath Carlisle Vollrath Vollrath C9964 Vollrath Spec Spec Vollrath
S 7.23| S 5.60| $ 6.80| S 7.25 7.20| S 7.19| S 7.75 7.78| S 8.00
6
Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath 91328 Stanton 1951-6 Spec Spec Vollrath
S 7.25| $ 8.10| S 6.80| S 6.54 7.20| S 3.87| S 7.75 7.78| S 8.00
7
Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath 91330 Stanton 1951-8 Spec Spec Vollrath
S 7.25| S 8.10| S 6.80| S 6.54 12.08( $ 3.87| S 7.75 7.78| S 8.25
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Des Moines Public Schools

Reinhart Food
Kessenich's Ltd. Pasco Rapids Foodservice Service Restaurant Link Sam Tell & Sons Star Food Service Sysco Tiger Chef
Item#| Madison, WI Plano, TX Marion, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Lawrence, KS Farmingdale NY Cedar Rapids, IA Ankeny, IA Suffern, Ny
8
Thunder Group
Spec Spec| Libertyware PC4W Mundial 52384 Update PC-4 Stanton PL259X Spec Dexter P177A-PCP SLTWPCO004
S 11.82| S 14.50| S 6.39| S 11.88| S 1.66| $ 2.28| S 12.19| $ 17.40| S 8.00
9
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 172.82| S 175.00 $ 160.46| S 167.00 S 180.17
10
Dexter SG142-8TE-
Spec Spec Spec Spec AdCraft CUT-8WABL Spec PCP Spec
S 9.54| S 11.50| $ 9.06| $ 9.68| $ 9.58| $ 3.17| S 9.92| $ 16.44| S 12.00
11
33 pk 102
Mundial 6 pk Spec Winco KWH-1 Spec Update KP-01 Dexter P40843 Spec Dexter S104PCP Winco KWH-1
S 3.27| $ 4.00[ $ 2.00| $ 3.32| S 2.09| S 1.63| S 341 $ 4.80( $ 7.50
12
Royal ROY PST Johnson-Rose
Spec Spec BRP300 Spec Royal PSTBRP300 Spec Carlisle 4039202 3930
S 6.89| $ 6.50 S 2.63| $ 8.39| $ 5.38] S 4.20( S 7.15| $ 7.75| $ 4.50
13 6pk must order 12
Cooper-Atkins 24HP-
Spec Spec Winco TMT-0V2 Taylor 3506 Update THOV-30 Stanton 2903 Spec 01-1 Spec
S 342| S 2.65| S 1.74| S 3.13] S 2.14| S 1.82| S 3.78] $ 432 S 6.00
14
6pk, must order 102
Cooper-Atkins 25HP-[ Thunder Group
Spec Spec Winco TMT-RF2 Spec Update THRE-20 Stanton 2907 Spec 01-1 SLTHDO80
S 2.42| S 1.90| S 1.52| S 2.48] S 1.61] $ 1.82| S 2.68] S 432 S 2.45
15
6 pk, must order 102
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Des Moines Public Schools

Reinhart Food
Kessenich's Ltd. Pasco Rapids Foodservice Service Restaurant Link Sam Tell & Sons | Star Food Service Sysco Tiger Chef
Item #| Madison, WI Plano, TX Marion, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Lawrence, KS Farmingdale NY Cedar Rapids, IA Ankeny, IA Suffern, Ny
Cooper Atkins
Spec Spec Winco TMT-D64 Spec Spec Spec DPP800W| Winco TMT-DG4
S 16.14 12.50| $ 6.27| S 15.15 16.50| $ 16.48| S 16.19 22.08 $ 13.00
16
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 368.66 375.00| S 378.19| S 393.50 429.44| S 396.16| S 410.00 413.36| $ 416.00
17
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 23.87 27.50( S 25.48( S 25.40 27.22( S 25.11| S 31.90 2735 $ 27.50
18
Spec Spec Winco PSC-14 Spec ABC PRO SCR-02 Spec Spec Spec
S 1.89 16.00| $ 4.80( S 11.00 1.85| $ 5.88| S 13.80 12.00| S 17.00
19
No Bid
Carlisle 3662000 Carlisle 4054602 Winco BRN-8P Carlisle 40545 Carlisle 3651300 Carlisle 4054102 Carlisle Winco BRN-8p
S 5.47 6.80| $ 2.79| S 7.62 1.80| S 4.80| $ 6.10 S 8.00
20
Spec Spec Winco PUT-12K Spec Spec Spec Spec| Winco PUT-12K
S 27.54 28.20 S 9.84| S 28.12 30.12 S 29.52| S 31.20 32.52 $ 35.00
21
priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Spec Stanton FP-1206 Spec Spec Spec
S 44.40 45.20| S 44.82] S 44.75 48.30( S 32.52 $ 50.04 52.20 $ 21.45
22
priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Spec Stanton FQC-1200 Spec Spec Spec
S 22.02 22.45( S 22.20( S 22.10 24.00( S 13.80| S 24.84 25.86( $ 28.08
23
No Bid priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 61.68 S 62.28| S 62.00 67.20| S 65.94( $ 66.60 72.54( $ 78.62

Q7009 Kitchen Equipment-Small Wares

6/6/2014



Des Moines Public Schools

Reinhart Food
Kessenich's Ltd. Pasco Rapids Foodservice Service Restaurant Link Sam Tell & Sons Star Food Service Sysco Tiger Chef
Item #| Madison, WI Plano, TX Marion, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Lawrence, KS Farmingdale NY Cedar Rapids, IA Ankeny, IA Suffern, Ny
24
No Bid priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Stanton FP-1306 Spec Spec Spec
33.48 S 33.78 33.32 36.48 24.66 37.74 39.36[ $ 42.67
25 No Bid
Spec Winco KWH-6 Spec Update KP-08| ADCraft CUT-8CKWH Mundial Dexter P94801 Winco KWH-6
S 13.38 S 557| S 20.50( $ 5.76] S 5.06| $ 14.97| $ 16.20| S 10.84
26 No Bid priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Stanton PCB-12186 Spec Spec Spec
S 71.40 S 72.12( S 72.02 S 77.76( S 73.32 $ 78.42| $ 84.00 $ 91.03
27
No Bid priced ea
Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec Spec
S 132.72 S 100.56| $ 131.80| $ 144.48( $ 158.88| $ 142.80( $ 156.24( $ 156.10
28
No Bid
San Jamar San Jamar San Jamar| Thunder Group
CB152012WH Winco CBT-1520 CB152012WH Update CB-1520 Stanton 799-20 Spec CB152012GVWH PLCBOO5
S 14.93 S 7.53| S 13.00| $ 7.98| S 8.66| S 11.80| $ 20.02 $ 11.52
29
No Bid
San Jamar San Jamar San Jamar| Thunder Group
CB182412GVWH Winco CBWT-1824 CB182412WH Update CB-1824 Stanton 799-24 Spec CB182412GVWH PLCBO06
S 27.91 S 11.15( $ 18.44| $ 11.82]| S 12.75 $ 17.50| S 27.66| S 17.16
30
No Bid No Bid 12 to case/ 10 cases priced ea No Bid
Spec| SanJamar KP196BN| San Jamar KP196GN Carlisle 1183209 Spec| SanJamar KP196GN
S 18.49| S 44.90| $ 20.16( S 18.00| S 23.70 S 43.56
31
No Bid No Bid 12 to case/10 cases priced ea No Bid
Spec| SanJamar KP196RD| San Jamar KP196RD Carlisle 1182905 Spec| SanJamar KP196RD
S 18.49] S 4490 S 20.16] S 18.00] S 23.70] S 43.56
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Des Moines Public Schools

Reinhart Food

Kessenich's Ltd. Pasco Rapids Foodservice Service Restaurant Link Sam Tell & Sons | Star Food Service Sysco Tiger Chef
Item #| Madison, WI Plano, TX Marion, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Lawrence, KS Farmingdale NY Cedar Rapids, IA Ankeny, IA Suffern, Ny
32
No Bid No Bid 100 per box 100 per box No Bid
Krowne Metal 25-
Spec Spec 123 FMP-142-1556 Spec FMP 142-1362
S 260.50| S 6.85| S 1.58 1241 $ 297.50| $ 1.68
33
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Krownw Metal 142- San Jamar
Spec Spec 1159 SFCROLLQT Spec FMP 142-1158
S 10.88| $ 9.92| $ 8.30 438( $ 11.95( $ 7.66
34
No Bid No Bid No Bid 300 per case No Bid
Spec| SanlJamar TST9343 Taylor 8766 Spec Day 409070311
S 23.25 S 35.63 113.89( $ 25.50( S 26.08
21 Days 30 Days 10 Bus. Days 21 Days 14 Days 30 Days 12-15 Bus Days 15-25 Days 5-20 Days

ltems 13,14,15 bid all
or none in case pack

Freight Not Included

No Freight for
orders over
$150.00
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