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BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT:                    Lincoln High School BID DATE: 2/8/2013

                       2600 SW 9th Street

                       Des Moines, IA  50315 TIME: 2:00 PM

BID PACKAGE:          Weight Room Equipment LOCATION: Des Moines Schools

1915 Prospect Road

SEALED BID#:             B6690 Des Moines, Iowa

Item # Description Quantity

Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

001 York Triple Rack Combo 8 4,300.00$   34,400.00$    -$               3,595.00$   28,760.00$   

     Make/Model Proposed:

002 York Multi-Function Bench 12 400.00$      4,800.00$      -$               345.00$      4,140.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

003 UMAX 7' Power Bar 16 405.00$      6,480.00$      131.98$      2,111.68$     195.00$      3,120.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

004 York ISO Grip Plate 45 lb. 48 46.50$         2,232.00$      46.47$         2,230.56$     42.75$         2,052.00$     

005 York ISO Grip Plate 35 lb. 32 36.00$         1,152.00$      38.37$         1,227.84$     33.25$         1,064.00$     

006 York ISO Grip Plate 25 lb. 32 25.80$         825.60$         27.88$         892.16$         23.75$         760.00$         

007 York ISO Grip Plate 10 lb. 48 10.30$         494.40$         12.77$         612.96$         9.75$           468.00$         

008 York ISO Grip Plate    5 lb. 48 5.15$           247.20$         6.98$           335.04$         5.15$           247.20$         

009 York ISO Grip Plate 2.5 lb. 48 2.60$           124.80$         3.98$           191.04$         2.55$           122.40$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

010 York 7' North American Bar 6 260.00$      1,560.00$      129.98$      779.88$         222.45$      1,334.70$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

011 York 45 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 86.00$         1,032.00$      79.98$         959.76$         50.95$         611.40$         

012 York 25 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 57.30$         687.60$         43.94$         527.28$         28.45$         341.40$         

013 York 10 lb. Rubber Bumper 18 35.75$         643.50$         22.98$         413.64$         12.45$         224.10$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

014 York Plate Rack - Full Set 3 245.00$      735.00$         -$               149.75$      449.25$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

015 York 2" Spring Collars (Pair) 22 5.00$           110.00$         3.74$           82.28$           4.65$           102.30$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

016 York Glute-Ham Bench 3 715.00$      2,145.00$      499.98$      1,499.94$     549.00$      1,647.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

017 York Dumbbell Set 5-50 lb. 2 660.00$      1,320.00$      274.90$      549.80$         535.35$      1,070.70$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

018 York Dumbbell Set 55-100 lb. 2 1,860.00$   3,720.00$      797.31$      1,594.62$     1,515.35$   3,030.70$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

019 York Dumbbell Rack 2 820.00$      1,640.00$      339.98$      679.96$         675.50$      1,351.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

020 Shipping 1

021 Installation 1

Total with Triple Combo Rack

022 York Double Half Rack 8 2,850.00$   22,800.00$    -$               -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

023 York Safety Spot Arms 16 200.00$      3,200.00$      -$               -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

024 Shipping 1

025 Installation 1

Total with Half Rack

Specified No Bid Specified

2nd Wind Exercise  

Clive, IA

BSN Sports        

Dallas, TX

Fitness Warehouse 

Winnetka, IL

Specified Champion RubberCoat Specified

Specified Champion 1101247 Specified

Specified No Bid Specified

Hampton 1B86APB Champion 1101248 Specified

Specified BSN 1015911 Specified

Specified Champion 814102 Specified

Specified Cap Barbell Specified

Specified No Bid Specified

Specified Champion 811100 Specified

64,349.10$                       14,688.44$                      50,896.15$                      

Specified Champion 1347/ 1 ea. Specified

Specified Champion 1347/ 1 ea. Specified

Addendum 1 Alternative

Item 022 (Half Rack) Replaces

Item 001 (Triple Rack) and

Item 023 is added to the bid.

2,000.00$                         -$                                  4,548.00$                         

1,949.00$                         Not Provided 975.00$                            

Specified No Bid No Bid

Specified No Bid No Bid

68,298.10$                       14,688.44$                      56,419.15$                      

1,949.00$                         No Bid No Bid

59,898.10$                       No Bid No Bid

55,949.10$                       No Bid No Bid

2,000.00$                         No Bid No Bid



Des Moines Public Schools
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BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT:                    Lincoln High School BID DATE: 2/8/2013

                       2600 SW 9th Street

                       Des Moines, IA  50315 TIME: 2:00 PM

BID PACKAGE:          Weight Room Equipment LOCATION: Des Moines Schools

1915 Prospect Road

SEALED BID#:             B6690 Des Moines, Iowa

Item # Description Quantity
Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

001 York Triple Rack Combo 8 4,642.88$   37,143.04$    3,695.00$   29,560.00$   4,612.50$   36,900.00$   

     Make/Model Proposed:

002 York Multi-Function Bench 12 483.88$      5,806.56$      355.00$      4,260.00$     768.75$      9,225.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

003 UMAX 7' Power Bar 16 269.98$      4,319.68$      181.00$      2,896.00$     198.75$      3,180.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

004 York ISO Grip Plate 45 lb. 48 54.68$         2,624.64$      43.50$         2,088.00$     47.81$         2,294.88$     

005 York ISO Grip Plate 35 lb. 32 42.48$         1,359.36$      33.80$         1,081.60$     37.19$         1,190.08$     

006 York ISO Grip Plate 25 lb. 32 30.38$         972.16$         24.15$         772.80$         26.56$         849.92$         

007 York ISO Grip Plate 10 lb. 48 12.18$         584.64$         9.66$           463.68$         10.63$         510.24$         

008 York ISO Grip Plate    5 lb. 48 6.08$           291.84$         4.84$           232.32$         5.33$           255.84$         

009 York ISO Grip Plate 2.5 lb. 48 3.08$           147.84$         2.43$           116.64$         2.66$           127.68$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

010 York 7' North American Bar 6 254.48$      1,526.88$      228.00$      1,368.00$     249.38$      1,496.28$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

011 York 45 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 64.28$         771.36$         51.14$         613.68$         56.25$         675.00$         

012 York 25 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 35.78$         429.36$         28.41$         340.92$         31.25$         375.00$         

013 York 10 lb. Rubber Bumper 18 14.28$         257.04$         11.37$         204.66$         12.50$         225.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

014 York Plate Rack - Full Set 3 209.18$      627.54$         153.00$      459.00$         167.50$      502.50$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

015 York 2" Spring Collars (Pair) 22 6.08$           133.76$         5.00$           110.00$         5.50$           121.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

016 York Glute-Ham Bench 3 764.78$      2,294.34$      557.00$      1,671.00$     562.50$      1,687.50$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

017 York Dumbbell Set 5-50 lb. 2 2,954.08$   5,908.16$      545.00$      1,090.00$     598.13$      1,196.26$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

018 York Dumbbell Set 55-100 lb. 2 -$                1,535.00$   3,070.00$     1,685.63$   3,371.26$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

019 York Dumbbell Rack 2 -$                677.00$      1,354.00$     550.00$      1,100.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

020 Shipping 1

021 Installation 1

Total with Triple Combo Rack

022 York Double Half Rack 8 -$                2,250.00$   18,000.00$   -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

023 York Safety Spot Arms 16 -$                177.00$      2,832.00$     -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

024 Shipping 1

025 Installation 1

Total with Half Rack

York CW70-635 Specified Legend 3222

Troy CW74-078 Specified Specified

Gopher Performance  

Owatonna, MN

The Gym Authority  

Waterloo, IA

Legend Fitness 

Knoxville, TN

Specified Specified Legend 3321

Specified Specified Specified

York CW68-498 Specified Specified

Specified Specified Specified

Troy CW70-981 Specified Specified

UltraFit CW68-154 Specified Specified

Included in Item 017 Specified Specified

York CW84-518 Specified Specified

York CW70-642 Specified Legend 3130-5

2,381.54$                         1,860.00$                         3,751.33$                         

Not Provided 2,225.00$                         3,500.00$                         

Included in Item 017 Specified Legend 3168

65,198.20$                       51,752.30$                      65,283.44$                      

Item 001 (Triple Rack) and

Item 023 is added to the bid.

No Bid Specified No Bid

67,579.74$                       55,837.30$                      72,534.77$                      

Addendum 1 Alternative

Item 022 (Half Rack) Replaces

No Bid 1,860.00$                         No Bid

No Bid 2,225.00$                         No Bid

No Bid Specified No Bid

No Bid 43,024.30$                      No Bid

No Bid 47,109.30$                      No Bid



Des Moines Public Schools
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BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT:                    Lincoln High School BID DATE: 2/8/2013

                       2600 SW 9th Street

                       Des Moines, IA  50315 TIME: 2:00 PM

BID PACKAGE:          Weight Room Equipment LOCATION: Des Moines Schools

1915 Prospect Road

SEALED BID#:             B6690 Des Moines, Iowa

Item # Description Quantity
Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

001 York Triple Rack Combo 8 5,350.00$   42,800.00$    3,823.53$   30,588.24$   4,195.00$   33,560.00$   

     Make/Model Proposed:

002 York Multi-Function Bench 12 535.00$      6,420.00$      364.71$      4,376.52$     485.00$      5,820.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

003 UMAX 7' Power Bar 16 -$                224.47$      3,591.52$     250.00$      4,000.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

004 York ISO Grip Plate 45 lb. 48 145.00$      6,960.00$      45.00$         2,160.00$     45.00$         2,160.00$     

005 York ISO Grip Plate 35 lb. 32 119.00$      3,808.00$      35.00$         1,120.00$     35.00$         1,120.00$     

006 York ISO Grip Plate 25 lb. 32 95.00$         3,040.00$      25.00$         800.00$         25.00$         800.00$         

007 York ISO Grip Plate 10 lb. 48 52.00$         2,496.00$      10.00$         480.00$         10.00$         480.00$         

008 York ISO Grip Plate    5 lb. 48 39.00$         1,872.00$      5.01$           240.48$         5.00$           240.00$         

009 York ISO Grip Plate 2.5 lb. 48 33.00$         1,584.00$      2.51$           120.48$         2.50$           120.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

010 York 7' North American Bar 6 320.00$      1,920.00$      234.71$      1,408.26$     395.00$      2,370.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

011 York 45 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 135.00$      1,620.00$      52.94$         635.28$         60.00$         720.00$         

012 York 25 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 79.00$         948.00$         29.41$         352.92$         35.00$         420.00$         

013 York 10 lb. Rubber Bumper 18 49.00$         882.00$         11.76$         211.68$         15.00$         270.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

014 York Plate Rack - Full Set 3 235.00$      705.00$         157.65$      472.95$         179.40$      538.20$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

015 York 2" Spring Collars (Pair) 22 8.00$           176.00$         4.53$           99.66$           9.00$           198.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

016 York Glute-Ham Bench 3 775.00$      2,325.00$      576.47$      1,729.41$     325.00$      975.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

017 York Dumbbell Set 5-50 lb. 2 1,050.00$   2,100.00$      562.94$      1,125.88$     550.00$      1,100.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

018 York Dumbbell Set 55-100 lb. 2 1,025.00$   2,050.00$      1,586.47$   3,172.94$     1,550.00$   3,100.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

019 York Dumbbell Rack 2 490.00$      980.00$         700.00$      1,400.00$     359.40$      718.80$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

020 Shipping 1

021 Installation 1

Total with Triple Combo Rack

022 York Double Half Rack 8 3,595.00$   28,760.00$    2,329.41$   18,635.28$   -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

023 York Safety Spot Arms 16 200.00$      3,200.00$      182.35$      2,917.60$     -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

024 Shipping 1

025 Installation 1

Total with Half Rack

MFAC, LLC      

Cranston, RI

Nova Fitness       

Omaha, NE

Pro Maxima      

Houston, TX

Specified Specified Pro Maxima Rack

Specified Specified Pro Maxima EZR

Specified Specified Pro Maxima Needle

Specified Specified Pro Maxima 13085

No Bid Specified Pro Maxima Bar

Specified Specified Pro Maxima AGG

Specified Specified Pro Maxima FW-40

Specified Specified Pro Maxima Bumpers

Specified Specified Pro Maxima FW-76

Specified Specified Pro Maxima FW-58

82,686.00$                       54,086.22$                      58,710.00$                      

Specified Specified Pro Maxima Hexr 1

Specified Specified Pro Maxima Hexr 2

82,686.00$                       57,031.22$                      64,610.00$                      

Addendum 1 Alternative

Item 022 (Half Rack) Replaces

-$                                   2,289.00$                         3,650.00$                         

Not Provided 656.00$                            2,250.00$                         

Specified Specified No Bid

71,846.00$                       45,050.86$                      No Bid

Item 001 (Triple Rack) and

Item 023 is added to the bid.

Specified Specified No Bid

71,846.00$                       47,995.86$                      No Bid

-$                                   2,289.00$                         No Bid

Not Provided 656.00$                            No Bid



Des Moines Public Schools
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BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT:                    Lincoln High School BID DATE: 2/8/2013

                       2600 SW 9th Street

                       Des Moines, IA  50315 TIME: 2:00 PM

BID PACKAGE:          Weight Room Equipment LOCATION: Des Moines Schools

1915 Prospect Road

SEALED BID#:             B6690 Des Moines, Iowa

Item # Description Quantity
Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

001 York Triple Rack Combo 8 3,963.50$   31,708.00$    -$               3,195.00$   25,560.00$   

     Make/Model Proposed:

002 York Multi-Function Bench 12 378.05$      4,536.60$      424.59$      5,095.08$     499.00$      5,988.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

003 UMAX 7' Power Bar 16 198.75$      3,180.00$      -$               240.00$      3,840.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

004 York ISO Grip Plate 45 lb. 48 46.65$         2,239.20$      -$               54.00$         2,592.00$     

005 York ISO Grip Plate 35 lb. 32 36.25$         1,160.00$      -$               42.00$         1,344.00$     

006 York ISO Grip Plate 25 lb. 32 25.90$         828.80$         -$               30.00$         960.00$         

007 York ISO Grip Plate 10 lb. 48 10.40$         499.20$         -$               12.00$         576.00$         

008 York ISO Grip Plate    5 lb. 48 5.20$           249.60$         -$               6.00$           288.00$         

009 York ISO Grip Plate 2.5 lb. 48 2.60$           124.80$         -$               3.00$           144.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

010 York 7' North American Bar 6 243.30$      1,459.80$      -$               180.00$      1,080.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

011 York 45 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 54.90$         658.80$         -$               54.00$         648.00$         

012 York 25 lb. Rubber Bumper 12 30.50$         366.00$         -$               30.00$         360.00$         

013 York 10 lb. Rubber Bumper 18 12.20$         219.60$         -$               12.00$         216.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

014 York Plate Rack - Full Set 3 163.40$      490.20$         181.85$      545.55$         159.00$      477.00$         

     Make/Model Proposed:

015 York 2" Spring Collars (Pair) 22 4.80$           105.60$         5.65$           124.30$         4.00$           88.00$           

     Make/Model Proposed:

016 York Glute-Ham Bench 3 597.60$      1,792.80$      -$               499.00$      1,497.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

017 York Dumbbell Set 5-50 lb. 2 583.55$      1,167.10$      -$               605.00$      1,210.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

018 York Dumbbell Set 55-100 lb. 2 1,644.50$   3,289.00$      -$               1,705.00$   3,410.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

019 York Dumbbell Rack 2 725.60$      1,451.20$      861.15$      1,722.30$     699.00$      1,398.00$     

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

020 Shipping 1

021 Installation 1

Total with Triple Combo Rack

022 York Double Half Rack 8 2,415.00$   19,320.00$    -$               3,195.00$   25,560.00$   

     Make/Model Proposed:

023 York Safety Spot Arms 16 189.00$      3,024.00$      -$               -$               

     Make/Model Proposed:

Subtotal Equipment

024 Shipping 1

025 Installation 1

Total with Half Rack

Push Pedal Pull    

Ankeny, IA

S&S Worldwide   

Colchester, CT

USA Fitness        

Cudahy, CA

Specified No Bid USA Fitness Bar

Specified No Bid USA Fitness USA-GOP

Specified No Bid USA Fitness Pro-TSR

Specified Specified USA Fitness USA-51

Specified Specified USA Fitness USA-505

Specified Specified USA Fitness USA-SC

Specified No Bid USA Fitness Bar

Specified No Bid USA Fitness USA-BB

Specified No Bid USA Fitness USA-RH 2

Specified Specified USA Fitness USA-120

Specified No Bid USA Fitness USA-525

Specified No Bid USA Fitness USA-RH 1

1,390.00$                         Not Provided 1,000.00$                         

58,516.30$                       7,487.23$                        53,676.00$                      

55,526.30$                       7,487.23$                         51,676.00$                      

1,600.00$                         -$                                  1,000.00$                         

No Bid USA Fitness Pro-TSR

Specified No Bid Included in Item 022

Addendum 1 Alternative

Item 022 (Half Rack) Replaces

Item 001 (Triple Rack) and

Item 023 is added to the bid.

Specified

1,390.00$                         No Bid 1,000.00$                         

49,152.30$                       No Bid 53,676.00$                      

46,162.30$                       No Bid 51,676.00$                      

1,600.00$                         No Bid 1,000.00$                         


