
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote: B6660

Date: 1/4/2013

Supervisor: Sheila Mason

Department: Operations

Description Qty

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Capital Sanitary                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

Pasco Brokerage                     

Plano, TX

Pueblo Hotel              

Pueblo, CO

Pyramid Prod. 

Tampa, FL

Sink Paper             

Urbandale, IA

Xpedx +                

Ankeny, IA

Make: Advance 10

Model: AWD315

Make Proposed:  Renown Advance Clarke Proteam No Bid Rubbermaid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: 08012-VP

AWD315 

56109594 021861A 107130 No Bid FG9VWD16000 No Bid No Bid E83012-00

State Warranty: 90 days

3 yrs parts & 2 

yrs labor

2 yrs parts / 

labor

4 yrs parts & 

labor No Bid NR No Bid No Bid See literature

Hold Prices:

Yes  Renown / 

No Windsor Yes Yes Yes No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days 10-14 days 7-14 days 5-7 days 5-9 days No Bid 30 days No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $            390.00  $            555.00  $            610.39  $            423.30  $                       -    $              284.41  $                       -    $                     -    $            588.00 

Upright Vacuum Cleaner 20

Make: Advance

Model: Advance Ad Vac 12 HP

Make Proposed: Renown Advance Clarke Sanitaire No Bid Rubbermaid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: 8025 Reliavac 12 hp 906020802 SC-684 No Bid FG9VCV120000 No Bid No Bid E88820-00 HF14

State Warranty: 90 days 1 yrs 1 yr parts/labor 2 yr No Bid NR No Bid No Bid See Literature

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days 10-14 days 7-14 days 5-7 days 5-7 days No Bid 30 days No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $            160.00  $            175.00  $            308.24  $            137.42  $                       -    $              128.71  $                       -    $                     -    $            324.00 

Portable Back Pack Vacuum 12

Make: Proteam 107303

Model: Super Coach Pro 10

Make Proposed: Proteam Proteam Proteam No Bid Rubbermaid No Bid No Bid Proteam

Model Proposed: 107303 107303 107303 No Bid FG9VBH100000 No Bid No Bid 107303

State Warranty:

3 yrs parts / 

labor / body

3 yrs parts & 

labor

4 yrs parts & 

labor No Bid NR No Bid No Bid NR

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days 14 days 7-21 days 5-9 days No Bid 30 days No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $            290.00  $            325.00  $            299.59  $                       -    $              258.46  $                       -    $                     -    $            382.00 

B6660 Custodial Equipment 1 1/7/2013



Des Moines Public Schools

Description Qty

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Capital Sanitary                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

Pasco Brokerage                     

Plano, TX

Pueblo Hotel              

Pueblo, CO

Pyramid Prod. 

Tampa, FL

Sink Paper             

Urbandale, IA

Xpedx +                

Ankeny, IA

Blue Recycle Waste Barrell 100

Make: Rubbermaid

Model: Brute FG 8632 or equal

Make Proposed: Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubermaid Rubbermaid^ Rubbermaid Rubbermaid# Continental Rubbermaid

Model Proposed: 263200BL 2632 / 2631 263200 BLU FG2631/FG2632 FG26327Blu

FG263200Blue 

No lid 3200-1 FG8632

State Warranty: NR NR 1 yr 1 yr NR 1 yr NR NR

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Delivery Days NR 14-21 days 2-3 weeks 21-30 days 30 days 21-30 days 10-14 days 14-21 days

Cost  $              12.70  $              18.90  $              12.96  $                 16.50  $                 23.98  $                 15.99  $              37.12  $              13.11 

Gray Waste Barrell 36

Make: Rubbermaid

Model: Brute FG 8632 or equal

Make Proposed: Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid^ Rubbermaid Rubbermaid# Continental Rubbermaid

Model Proposed: 263200GY 2632 / 2631 2632 / 2631 FG2631/FG2632 FG263200Gry

FG263200Gray 

No lid 3200GY FG8632

State Warranty: NR NR 1 yr 1 yr NR 1 yr NR NR

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Delivery Days 14 days 14-21 days 2-3 weeks 21-30 days 30 days 21-30 days 10-14 days 14-21 days

Cost  $              12.70  $              18.90  $              17.26  $                 16.50  $                 23.98  $                 15.99  $              21.40  $              13.11 

Waste Barrel Dolly 136

To Fit Rubbermaid Brute FG 8632 w/ wheels

Make Proposed: Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid^ Rubbermaid Rubbermaid# Continental Rubbermaid

Model Proposed: 264000BLA 2640 BLA 2640 BLA FG26400 BLA FG264000Bla FG2640 3255 FG8632

State Warranty: NR NR 1 yr 1 yr NR 1 yr NR NR

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Delivery Days 14 days 14-21 days 2-3 weeks 21-30 days NR 21-30 days 10-14 days 14-21 days

Cost  $              14.85  $              18.35  $              16.59  $                 15.95  $                 37.58  $                 18.99  $              21.40  $              16.98 

Desk Mover 5

Make Wesco

Model:272157

Make Proposed: Wesco No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model Proposed: 27157 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

State Warranty: NR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hold Prices: Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Days 14 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cost  $            232.00  $                     -    $                     -    $                     -    $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $                     -   
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Des Moines Public Schools

Description Qty

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Capital Sanitary                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

Pasco Brokerage                     

Plano, TX

Pueblo Hotel              

Pueblo, CO

Pyramid Prod. 

Tampa, FL

Sink Paper             

Urbandale, IA

Xpedx +                

Ankeny, IA

Square Waste Baskets - 22 gal 10

Make:  Rubbermaid

Model:   Untouchable Square ContainerFG356988

Make Proposed: Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid^ Rubbermaid Rubbermaid# No Bid Rubbermaid

Model Proposed: 356988 FG356988 356988 FG356988 FG356988Gry FG356988 No Bid FG356988

State Warranty: NR NR 1 yr 1 yr NR 1 yr No Bid NR

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid Yes

Delivery Days 14 days 14-21 day 3-4 weeks 21-30 days 30 days 21-30 days No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $              24.25  $              27.00  $              24.69  $                 23.50  $                 44.63  $                 32.95  $                     -    $              24.94 

Floor Dryers 4

Make: Nilfisk Advance 

Model: Hydro Dry

Make Proposed: Windsor Renown SSS Viper Powerflite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: WINAM3 08010-VP Puma 86020 PD500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid E85507-00

State Warranty:

3 yrs parts & 

service 10 yr 

housing See Literature 5 yr

5 yrs housing / 1 

yr parts/ labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/3/1

Hold Prices: Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days 14 days 14 days 14-21 days NR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $            170.00  $            163.00  $            196.20  $            172.95  $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $            131.00 

Onboard Scrubber 6

Make/Model: Windsor Chariot iScrub 20

Make Proposed: Windsor No Bid Clarke* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: 9.840-810.0 No Bid 56382626 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid E29960-00

State Warranty: 10/10/10 No Bid 3 parts/labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NR

Hold Prices: No No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days NR No Bid 7-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $         4,850.00  $                     -    $         8,515.68  $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $         5,773.00 

Carpet Extractor 6

Make: Windsor

Model:  Clipper Duo

Make Proposed: Windsor No Bid Clarke** No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: Clipper Duo No Bid 56382724 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid FP8

State Warranty: 10/10/10 No Bid

1 yr parts / 

labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/3

Hold Prices: No No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days NR No Bid 7-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $         2,780.00  $                     -    $         2,186.99  $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $         1,811.00 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Description Qty

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Amsan                    

Urbandale, IA

Capital Sanitary                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

National 

Everything Whs                

Omaha, NE

Pasco Brokerage                     

Plano, TX

Pueblo Hotel              

Pueblo, CO

Pyramid Prod. 

Tampa, FL

Sink Paper             

Urbandale, IA

Xpedx +                

Ankeny, IA

Mini Extractor / Spotter 6

Make: Windsor

Model:  Presto

Make Proposed: Windsor SSS Viper Clarke No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed: Presto Wildcat 86030 84153A BexSpot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid E85509

State Warranty: 10/10/10 5 yrs

1 yr parts / 

labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/3

Hold Prices: No Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days NR 14-21 days 7-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $            475.00  $            290.00  $            639.50  $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $            484.00 

Propane Burnisher 5

Make: Advance 

Model: PBU 27" 

Make Proposed: Windsor Advance Clarke** No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Betco

Model Proposed:

1.022-323.0 

Lighting

PBU27 

56381405 56381409 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Optima E12714-

00

State Warranty: 10/10/10 NR 2 yr parts/ labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/3

Hold Prices: No Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes

Delivery Days NR 7-14 days 7-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Cost  $         3,072.00  $         2,962.00  $         4,109.88  $                       -    $                       -    $                       -    $                     -    $         3,036.00 
Total 80,399.30$       652.00$             35,620.80$       111,063.02$     6,981.40$         11,704.20$         14,236.76$         12,142.78$         7,392.80$         80,813.64$       

* Excludes batteries

** Price for less than five units $ 2,2299.49; less than three units $ 4,309.88

^ Must be ordered in case pack case pack = 6

# Minimum order quantities

+ Pricing is dictated by quantities purchased

B6660 Custodial Equipment 4 1/7/2013


